
Mississippi Municipal Attorney 
Association 

January 2026 

Municipal Property Cleanup: The Good, the Bad and the 
Ugly 
I. Mississippi Code § 21-19-11 
Mississippi Code § 21-19-11 provides a process for municipal property cleanup. This statute 
establishes two distinct cleanup procedures: 

• Section (1): General cleanup process for all municipalities 
• Section (2): Expedited process available only for municipalities with populations over 

1,500 

II. The Cleanup Process Under Section (1) 
A. Initiating the Process 
To determine whether property or a parcel of land located within a municipality is in such a 
state of uncleanliness as to be a menace to the public health, safety, and welfare of the 
community, a governing authority of any municipality shall conduct a hearing, on its own 
motion, or upon receipt of a petition signed by a majority of the residents residing within 400 
feet of any property or parcel of land alleged to be in need of cleaning. 
Note: A hearing IS NOT required for a Section (2) cleanup (municipalities over 1,500 
population). 

B. Notice Requirements 
Notice shall be provided to the property owner by: 

1. United States Mail – Notice must be mailed two (2) weeks before the date of the 
hearing to: 

• The address of the subject property (except where the land or structure(s) is 
apparently vacant), AND 

• The address where the ad valorem tax notice for such property is sent by the tax 
collector 

Important Notes: 
• This is regular mail, not certified mail 
• The obligation is to mail within the required timeframe 
• Best practice: Mail to both the property address and the tax statement address, even 

if different 
• Don't get caught up in the "apparently vacant" exception – document your mailing to 

both addresses 
2. Posted Notice – Notice must be posted for at least two (2) weeks before the date 

of the hearing: 
• On the property or parcel of land alleged to be in need of cleaning, AND 
• At city hall or another place in the municipality where such notices are posted 

Best Practice: Post the notice and document it with photographs and dates. 

C. Required Notice Content 
Any notice required by this section shall include language that informs the property 
owner that an adjudication at the hearing that the property or parcel of land is in need of 



cleaning will authorize the municipality to reenter the property or parcel of land for a period of 
two (2) years after final adjudication without any further hearing if notice is posted on the 
property or parcel of land and at city hall or another place in the municipality where such 
notices are generally posted at least seven (7) days before the property or parcel of land is 
reentered for cleaning. 
CRITICAL: A copy of the required notice mailed and posted as required by this section shall 
be recorded in the minutes of the governing authority in conjunction with the hearing 
required by this section. 
DO NOT FORGET: This notice MUST be in the minutes! 

D. The Hearing and Adjudication 
If, at such hearing, the governing authority shall adjudicate the property or parcel of land in 
its then condition to be a menace to the public health, safety, and welfare of the community, 
the governing authority, if the owner does not do so himself, shall proceed to clean the land, 
by the use of municipal employees or by contract. 

E. What Can Be Cleaned/Removed 
Authorized cleanup activities include: 

• Cutting grass and weeds 
• Filling cisterns 
• Securing abandoned or dilapidated buildings 
• Removing rubbish, abandoned or dilapidated fences, outside toilets, abandoned or 

dilapidated buildings, slabs 
• Removing personal property (which removal of personal property shall not be 

subject to the provisions of Section 21-39-21) 
• Removing other debris 
• Draining cesspools and standing water 

F. Important Clarifications 
1. "In Its Then Condition" 
This means the condition of the property at the time of the hearing. We require a Staff 
Report that provides the basis for setting the public hearing, and for cleanups requiring a 
public hearing, the report should be updated to reflect the current condition at the time of the 
hearing. Property owners do try to clean up, and any such efforts need to be acknowledged 
and addressed. 
2. What is Section 21-39-21? 
Section 21-39-21 governs lost and abandoned property. The clarification that personal 
property removal under 21-19-11 is not subject to 21-39-21 means you do not need to follow 
the abandoned property statute for items removed during cleanup. 
Important: Personal property means everything that is not real property. The statute 
contemplates that removed items are trash to be disposed of, not items to be sold to offset 
cleanup costs. You are to adjudicate the cost of cleaning, including disposal, and add a 
penalty. 
What if you remove a vehicle with value? First, consider why you're removing it – what 
made it a menace while also having discernible value? This creates a conflict. If you find 
yourself with personal property that has value, consider using Section 21-39-21 after 
removal. The Attorney General's Opinion to Maxey discusses declaring such property 
abandoned if not claimed within a reasonable time. 
3. Personal Property Removal Example 
Some communities send letters notifying residents of cleanup dates for bulk items 
(appliances, furniture, etc.). On the specified date, residents place items at the curb, and the 
city picks them up. This is NOT a 21-19-11 action. The statute requires a showing that the 
property is a menace to public health, safety, and welfare. Curbside bulk pickup is a service, 
not a cleanup action under this statute. 



G. Costs and Penalties 
The governing authority may by resolution: 

• Adjudicate the actual cost of cleaning the property 
• Impose a penalty not to exceed $1,500.00 or fifty percent (50%) of the actual cost, 

whichever is more 
Definition of "Cost": 
The "cost assessed against the property" means: 

• The cost to the municipality of using its own employees to do the work, OR 
• The cost to the municipality of any contract executed by the municipality to have the 

work done 
• Plus: Administrative costs and legal costs of the municipality 

Collection: 
The cost and any penalty may become: 

• A civil debt against the property owner, AND/OR 
• At the option of the governing authority, an assessment against the property 

H. Subsequent Cleanups and Cost Limitations 
For subsequent cleaning within the one-year period after the date of the hearing at which 
the property was adjudicated in need of cleaning: 
Notice Requirements: 

• Seven (7) days' notice posted both on the property and at city hall 
• No further hearing required 

Frequency Limitations: 
• No more than six (6) times in any twelve-month period with respect to: 
• Removing or securing abandoned or dilapidated buildings, slabs, dilapidated fences, 

and outside toilets 
• No more than twelve (12) times in any twenty-four-month period with respect to: 
• Cutting grass and weeds and removing rubbish, personal property, and other debris 

Cost Limitations: 
• The expense of cleaning shall not exceed an aggregate amount of $20,000.00 per 

year, or the fair market value of the property subsequent to cleaning, 
whichever is more 

• Exception: The aggregate cost of removing hazardous substances will be the 
actual cost of such removal to the municipality and shall not be subject to the cost 
limitations provided in this subsection 

• The governing authority may assess the same penalty for each time the property or 
land is cleaned 

I. State Property Exception 
Important: The penalty provided shall not be assessed against the State of Mississippi upon 
request for reimbursement under Section 29-1-145, nor shall a municipality clean a parcel 
owned by the State of Mississippi without first giving notice. 
Upon written authority from the Secretary of State's office, for state-owned properties, a 
municipality may forgo the notification process prescribed in this subsection and proceed to 
clean the properties and assess costs as prescribed (except that penalties shall not be 
assessed against the State of Mississippi). 

III. Process for Municipalities Over 1,500 Population 
Section (2) of the statute provides an expedited process for municipalities with populations 
over 1,500. Key differences/points: 

• No hearing required 
• Administrative action possible 
• Simplified notice procedures 
• Property must be less than one acre. 



• Clean up cost cannot exceed $250.00 
• Penalty not to exceed $100 or 100% of the clean up cost whichever is more. 
• Can include administrative costs not to exceed $50.00. 
• Subsequent cleaning within 12 month period permitted.  Have to post notice at least 

7 days’ prior on the land and city hall or other public place. 
• Cannot exceed an aggregate of $1,000 per year. 
• Limitations regarding state owned property. 

IV. Perpetual Care Cemeteries - Section (7) 
If private property or a parcel of land located within a municipality is a perpetual care 
cemetery subject to Section 41-43-1 et seq., the governing authority may use similar 
provisions to determine if the perpetual care cemetery and all structures on the cemetery are 
not being properly maintained and have become detrimental to public health and welfare. 
"Not Being Properly Maintained" means: 
A perpetual care cemetery that shows signs of neglect, including, without limitation: 

• Unchecked growth of vegetation 
• Repeated and unchecked acts of vandalism 
• Unusable entrances and exits 
• Excess rubbish or debris 
• Disintegration of grave markers or boundaries 

Special Provisions for Cemeteries: 
• No penalties shall be assessed against owners of perpetual care cemeteries 
• Municipalities may apply to the Secretary of State for reimbursement from the 

perpetual care cemetery trust fund 
• Reimbursement limited to actual cleanup costs only 
• Secretary of State may order release of accrued interest or (in limited circumstances) 

up to 15% of principal 
• May be utilized no more than once in a four-year period 

Note: We do not have a perpetual care cemetery and I've never used this section. Good 
luck! 

V. Important Case Law 
Okhuysen v. City of Starkville, 333 So.2d 573 (Miss. App. 2022). 
This case is critical for understanding inspection and entry rights. Key holdings: 

1. Article 3, Section 23 of the Mississippi Constitution is considered more broadly than 
the 4th Amendment to the U.S. Constitution. It applies more broadly to persons, 
houses, and possessions. 

2. The protection applies to all land owned by the person searched, and thus far, 
Mississippi courts have never made an "open field exception" or "expectation of 
privacy" distinction. 

3. Inspector committed a trespass when he went onto the owner's property without 
permission, even if he thought he had a good faith right to enter. 

4. Municipal ordinances cannot authorize a search that the Mississippi 
Constitution prohibits. 

5. Warrant requirement applies to administrative inspections intended to verify 
compliance with municipal health codes or building codes. 

6. Permission for entry should be sought from the owner. The request for entry 
should be based on probable cause. In the event permission is denied, the inspector 
should obtain a warrant from the court. 

7. What about plain view? What you can see from the street, outside of the house, is 
fair game. Also, your folks were probably called by neighbors. If neighbors let you 
onto their property, that may provide additional plain-view observation. (Make sure 



you explain that inspectors cannot use cameras to look into someone's house from 
outside. Anywhere that there is an expectation of privacy is protected.) 

8. Ask permission. If denied, get a warrant. Period. 
9. Check your ordinances and make sure that administrative access provisions are 

deleted. (Note: We have some in the ordinances I provided. We do not use them, 
and I need to clean them up.) 

Gaffney v. City of Ridgeland, 202 So. 3d 238 (Miss. App. 2016) 
(Additional case law and analysis can be referenced in materials.) 

VI. Alternative Code Enforcement Tools 
A. Nuisance Ordinances (Most Effective Tool) 
Most municipalities have nuisance ordinances that complement 21-19-11. Example 
provisions: 

• Defining what constitutes a public nuisance 
• Requiring property maintenance 
• Prohibiting accumulation of junk, debris, or overgrown vegetation 
• Establishing penalties for violations 

Our Experience with Nuisance Ordinances: 
We send approximately 1,500 letters annually under our nuisance ordinance. Our process: 

10. Initial letter with definite timeline for compliance 
11. Over 95% are addressed without issue from this initial letter 
12. For the remainder, we send follow-up correspondence and reach out to understand if 

it's a matter of "won't do it" or "can't do it" 
13. In all but a handful of cases, there's an issue preventing compliance (death, loss of 

job, sickness, etc.). We work with these folks on a compliance plan 
14. For the remainder, we take them to court 
15. Of cases where we file charges, all but about 5% are resolved before court 
16. For the remainder, we have trials and let the court resolve the issue 
17. Last year, of 1,500+ letters, we had fewer than 10 cases that had to be tried, and 

of those, we entered into agreed orders and had them resolved within a short period 

B. Junkyard Ordinances 
Cars are a problem. We define a junkyard as three or more inoperable vehicles located 
within 10 feet of each other. We've used this ordinance effectively. 

C. Junked Appliances Ordinance 
We have companion ordinances to our nuisance ordinance that prevent the keeping of 
junked vehicles, appliances, and/or equipment on the premises. This ties into our nuisance 
ordinance and provides inspection authority (though note the limitations discussed in 
Okhuysen v. City of Starkville). 

D. Open Storage Ordinance 
Ordinance preventing the open storage of rubbish, salvage materials, junk, or hazardous 
waste materials, including inoperable vehicles. 

E. Section 21-19-21 (Structures Damaged by Fire) 
Important note: There is no notice provision in this statute, and the Attorney General is 
uncomfortable with no notice (see Baker opinion). 
Also, there is no way to recoup expenses as provided in 21-19-11; however, the Attorney 
General suggests a civil action for actual expenses. 
  



VII. Key Takeaways and Best Practices 
18. Follow the statute meticulously – especially notice requirements 
19. Document everything – photos, mailings, postings, minutes 
20. Remember to record notices in the minutes – this is mandatory! 
21. Respect property rights – ask permission before entering property, get a warrant if 

denied 
22. Use nuisance ordinances as your primary tool – they're more flexible and 

effective for most situations 
23. Work with property owners – most compliance issues stem from inability, not 

unwillingness 
24. Keep up with case law – especially regarding constitutional protections and 

inspection rights 
25. Review and clean up your ordinances – remove provisions that conflict with 

Okhuysen 
26. Maintain good records – especially for cost recovery purposes 
27. Don't confuse service programs with enforcement actions – bulk pickup days 

are not 21-19-11 actions 

Questions? 

































































Gaffney v. City of Richland, 202 So.3d 238 (Miss. App. 2016)

202 So.3d 238

Michael B. Gaffney, Appellant
v.

City of Richland, Mississippi, Appellee

NO. 2014-CA-01648-COA

Court of Appeals of Mississippi.

October 4, 2016

LINDSEY MCGEE TURK, FOR APPELLANT.

JOSHUA J. WIENER, DONNA BROWN JACOBS, 
KATIE B. SNELL, FOR APPELLEE.

BEFORE LEE, C.J., BARNES AND ISHEE, JJ.

LEE, C.J., FOR THE COURT:

FACTS AND PROCEDURAL HISTORY

I. 2002 to 2012

¶ 1. On February 27, 2002, the City of Richland 
issued a building permit to Michael 

[202 So.3d 239]

Gaffney to start building a house at 126 Hemlock 
Drive in Richland, Mississippi. The permit 
indicated that it would become void if work or 
construction did not commence within six months 
of the date of issuance, or if work was suspended 
or abandoned for a period of six months at any 
time after work started. After obtaining the 
permit, Gaffney began construction.

¶ 2. In a letter dated April 16, 2007—over five 
years after the issuance of the permit—Gaffney 
was notified that the building permit was void and 
was ordered to stop work. Jeff Sims, the building 
official for the City, testified that he typically 
received a request for an inspection prior to a 
builder moving on to the next phase of 
construction. According to Sims, he had not 
received such a request from Gaffney in three 
years. Subsequently, Gaffney applied for a second 

set of permits, which were issued with the same 
six-month provisions.

¶ 3. In a letter dated May 5, 2012—over ten years 
after the issuance of the original building 
permit—the City notified Gaffney that the second 
set of permits was void. According to Sims, 
Gaffney had suspended or abandoned 
construction again. Aggrieved, Gaffney asked to 
be heard by the Board of Aldermen.

II. Complaint

¶ 4. In the meantime, in November 2012, the City 
filed a complaint against Gaffney in the Chancery 
Court of Rankin County, claiming:

(1) Gaffney repeatedly failed to 
complete construction;

(2) Gaffney failed to maintain the 
property;

(3) The property constituted a 
danger and/or nuisance under 
Mississippi Code Annotated section 
21–19–11 (Rev. 2015); and

(4) Gaffney breached the terms of 
the building permits as well as his 
representations and covenants to 
the City.

¶ 5. The City requested the following relief:

(1) Enjoin Gaffney to complete 
construction within a period of time 
determined by the chancery court;

(2) In the event Gaffney failed to 
complete construction, 
authorization of demolition and 
removal;

(3) Reasonable attorney's fees and 
costs; and

(4) Other relief to which the City 
may be entitled.



Gaffney v. City of Richland, 202 So.3d 238 (Miss. App. 2016)

III. 2012 to 2014

¶ 6. Notwithstanding the filing of the complaint, 
on December 18, 2012, the Board passed a 
resolution allowing Gaffney to obtain new permits 
and complete construction by April 2, 2013. 
However, according to the City, Gaffney did not 
complete construction.

¶ 7. On April 16, 2013, the Board passed another 
resolution allowing Gaffney an additional sixty 
days to complete construction. Gaffney was issued 
new permits, which stated: “Per Resolution of 
[the] Board ... [April 16, 2013], all construction to 
be completed no later than [June 16, 2013] in 
accordance with applicable codes .... No further 
permits shall be issued.” According to the City, 
Gaffney did not complete construction again. As a 
result, in September 2013, the City filed an 
amended complaint in the chancery court.

IV. August 19, 2014 Hearing

¶ 8. Because Gaffney was a pro se litigant, the 
chancellor granted Gaffney a standing objection 
to all matters at the August 19, 2014 hearing.

[202 So.3d 240]

A. Testimony

¶ 9. An inspection of Gaffney's house took place a 
few days before the hearing. Sims testified that 
electrical extension cords and water hoses were 
being run from the neighboring house to 
Gaffney's house. Sims also noted the following 
issues with Gaffney's house: electrical issues; the 
ditch alongside the house was eroding into the 
foundation and in need of a retaining wall; an air-
conditioning unit blocked egress through a 
window; the concrete slab lacked flooring; the 
door landing lacked a staircase; a leak over the 
dishwasher in the kitchen; broken glass on the 
floor; clothing in a closet and a bed leaning up 
against a wall, indicating Gaffney was occupying 
the house; and an RV outside.

¶ 10. Gaffney testified that the concrete slab 
would be stained; the leak over the dishwasher 

was from a small refrigerator sitting on the 
counter; and the glass on the floor was safety 
glass. Gaffney also testified that he had never 
occupied the house.

B. Ruling1

¶ 11. The chancery court ordered Gaffney to 
complete construction no later than 5:00 p.m. on 
September 5, 2014. Gaffney was ordered to 
immediately disconnect and remove electrical 
extension cords and water hoses running from the 
neighboring property, make arrangements for a 
temporary power pole, and refrain from 
occupying the house. The chancery court also 
indicated that it would award attorney's fees, 
provided the City submitted claims for such. 
Finally, Gaffney was advised

of the potential remedies and relief 
which the [chancery court] may 
impose should [Gaffney] fail to 
comply with the [chancery court's] 
orders herein, including but not 
limited to granting the City the right 
to commence demolition ... and/or 
such other remedies and relief 
which the [chancery court] may find 
in order.

V. October 8, 2014 Hearing

¶ 12. In September 2014, the City filed a motion to 
hold Gaffney in contempt for failing to comply 
with the chancery court order. The City also filed 
a motion for attorney's fees and costs.

¶ 13. In early October 2014, Gaffney filed a motion 
to continue the hearing. Gaffney also filed a 
motion to dismiss and strike the City's motion to 
hold him in contempt. The chancery court denied 
Gaffney's motion to continue, and a hearing was 
held on October 8, 2014.

¶ 14. Donald Jones, the building inspector for the 
City, testified that an inspection was conducted at 
5:00 p.m. on September 5, 2014. Jones testified 
that although there had been some improvements 
to the house, construction was not complete. 



Gaffney v. City of Richland, 202 So.3d 238 (Miss. App. 2016)

Jones stated that Gaffney removed the extension 
cords and water hoses and, to his knowledge, 
Gaffney had not occupied the house. But, 
according to Jones, a final inspection could not 
take place because no temporary power pole had 
been erected and there were no utilities. Jones 
also testified that there was still no retaining wall.

¶ 15. When the chancery court asked Gaffney if he 
had finished construction, Gaffney responded, 
“Yes, I think I have.” According to Gaffney, he 
tried to obtain a temporary power pole, but 
Entergy did not provide the power pole until a 
week after the September 5 inspection. And 
Gaffney testified that utilities were not hooked up 
because he had to go through the City to get them 
turned on.

¶ 16. At this point, the hearing was recessed, and 
another inspection took place. Sims returned 
from the inspection and testified 

[202 So.3d 241]

that there were no utilities; there was no retaining 
wall; there were receptacles without covers, a 
breaker was missing for the air-conditioning unit; 
there was improper access to HVAC unit; the 
water-heater drain was installed improperly; 
there were no fixtures in a bathroom; and there 
were personal belongings inside the house. Sims 
stated: “We would not let anybody move in that 
house with the electrical issue as it is .... The 
retaining wall is a big issue.” When asked if the 
house was “anywhere close to being ready for 
occupancy,” Sims stated, “I can say it's close, but 
it's not there.”

¶ 17. Gaffney testified that there was “not that 
much left to do.” He testified that there were only 
minor issues inside of the house, and the outside 
of the house was complete but for the retaining 
wall and the main sewer line.

¶ 18. Ultimately, the chancery court found 
Gaffney in contempt for failing to complete 
construction by September 5, 2014, and 
authorized demolition of the house.2 The 

chancery court also awarded the City $8,232.82 
in attorney's fees.

VI. Appeal

¶ 19. Gaffney appeals, asserting: (1) the house 
does not rise to the level of a menace to the public 
health, safety, and welfare of the community as 
contemplated by section 21–19–11 ; (2) he was 
denied a fair trial as a result of the chancellor's 
conduct throughout the proceedings; and (3) the 
chancery court erred in awarding attorney's fees 
to the City.

DISCUSSION

¶ 20. Section 21–19–11(1) provides in part:

To determine whether property or 
parcel of land located within a 
municipality is in such a state of 
uncleanliness as to be a menace to 
the public health, safety[,] and 
welfare of the community, a 
governing authority of any 
municipality shall conduct a 
hearing , on its own motion, or 
upon the receipt of a petition signed 
by a majority of the residents 
residing within four hundred (400) 
feet of any property or parcel of land 
alleged to be in need of the cleaning.

....

If, at such hearing, the 
governing authority shall 
adjudicate the property or parcel 
of land in its then condition to be a 
menace to the public health, 
safety[,] and welfare of the 
community, the governing 
authority, if the owner does not do 
so himself, shall proceed to clean 
the land, by the use of municipal 
employees or by contract, by cutting 
grass and weeds; filling cisterns; 
removing rubbish, abandoned or 
dilapidated fences, outside toilets, 



Gaffney v. City of Richland, 202 So.3d 238 (Miss. App. 2016)

abandoned or dilapidated buildings, 
slabs, personal property, which 
removal of personal property shall 
not be subject to the provisions of 
Section 21-39-21, and other debris; 
and draining cesspools and standing 
water therefrom.

(Emphasis added).

¶ 21. Mississippi Code Annotated section 11–51–
75 (Rev. 2012) sets forth the procedure for 
appeals from judgment or decision by municipal 
authorities. “[Section 11–51–75 ] states that the 
person aggrieved may ‘embody the facts, 
judgment and decision in a bill of exceptions' 
which will be transmitted to the circuit court 
acting as an appellate court.’ ” Van Meter v. City 
of Greenwood , 724 So.2d 925, 928 (¶ 7) 
(Miss.Ct.App.1998).

[202 So.3d 242]

¶ 22. Because the “governing municipal authority” 
(i.e., the Board) was the appropriate entity to 
conduct a hearing, with any appeal being to the 
circuit court, the chancery court lacked 
jurisdiction over any claim brought under section 
21–19–11. See Pierce v. Pierce , 132 So.3d 553, 
560 (¶ 14) (Miss.2014) (“the issue of subject-
matter jurisdiction may be raised at any time in 
the proceedings, including on appeal.”).

¶ 23. Although the chancery court's jurisdiction 
encompasses relief sought through injunction, 
issuance of an injunction is an extraordinary relief 
requiring first a showing of “imminent threat of 
irreparable harm for which there is no adequate 
remedy at law.” Heidkamper v. Odom , 880 So.2d 
362, 365 (¶ 11) (Miss.Ct.App.2004). When a 
statutory scheme exists concerning review of an 
agency or board's decision, an adequate remedy at 
law exists, precluding the issuance of injunctive 
relief. A – 1 Pallet Co. v. City of Jackson , 40 
So.3d 563, 569 (¶ 22) (Miss.2010).

¶ 24. The City asks this Court to find, separate 
and apart from section 21–19–11, that a 
municipality has the authority to impose 

deadlines for completing construction of a 
dwelling. Keeping in mind the relief requested by 
the City and granted by the chancery court, the 
City is also asking this Court to find that 
noncompliance with any such deadlines 
authorizes the municipality to demolish the 
dwelling.

¶ 25. The City cites to several Mississippi cases for 
support; however, these cases were brought 
pursuant to section 21–19–11 or the equivalent 
thereof. See Bond v. City of Moss Point , 240 
So.2d 270, 270–71 (Miss.1970) (a local ordinance 
authorized demolition and removal of dwellings 
constituting a public nuisance); Bray v. City of 
Meridian , 723 So.2d 1200, 1202–03 (¶ 17) 
(Miss.Ct.App.1998) ; Pearson v. City of Louisville 
, 2008 WL 4814051 (N.D.Miss. Nov. 4, 2008).

¶ 26. The City also cites to several unpublished 
opinions from other jurisdictions; however, the 
claims in these cases were brought pursuant to 
statute, local ordinance, or a homeowners 
association's covenants, conditions, and 
restrictions (CC & R). See City of Westfield v. Saia 
, 73 Mass.App.Ct. 1119, 2009 WL 275768 
(Mass.Ct.App. Feb. 6, 2009) (a local ordinance 
imposed a five-year deadline for the completion of 
a condominium project); Ray v. Bd. of Union 
Twp. Trs. , 2007 WL 1731434 (Oh.Ct.App. Jun. 
18, 2007) (statute and zoning resolutions 
authorized removal of uncompleted residences); 
Nellie Gail Ranch Owners Ass'n v. Colombo, 2013 
WL 6243510 (Cal.Ct.App. Dec. 3, 2013) (a 
homeowners association's CC & R required 
completion of a residence within one year); 
Urbanski v. City of St. Paul, 2011 WL 1938189 
(Minn. Ct. App. May 23, 2011) (statute and local 
ordinance authorized nuisance-abatement 
actions). In the instant case, the City does not cite 
to any such statute, ordinance, or homeowners 
association's CC & R.

¶ 27. Accordingly, we reverse the chancellor's 
judgment and remand this case for the entry of an 
order of dismissal for lack of subject-matter 
jurisdiction and failure to state a claim upon 
which relief can be granted.



Gaffney v. City of Richland, 202 So.3d 238 (Miss. App. 2016)

¶ 28. THE JUDGMENT OF THE CHANCERY 
COURT OF RANKIN COUNTY IS 
REVERSED, AND THIS CASE IS 
REMANDED FOR ENTRY OF AN ORDER 
OF DISMISSAL. ALL COSTS OF THIS 
APPEAL ARE ASSESSED TO THE 
APPELLEE.

BARNES, ISHEE, FAIR, JAMES, WILSON AND 
GREENLEE, JJ., CONCUR. IRVING, P.J., AND 
CARLTON, J., CONCUR IN RESULT 

[202 So.3d 243]

ONLY WITHOUT SEPARATE WRITTEN 
OPINION. GRIFFIS, P.J., DISSENTS WITHOUT 
SEPARATE WRITTEN OPINION.

--------

Notes:

1 An order incorporating the chancellor's bench 
ruling was entered on August 28, 2014.

2 Demolition was to occur no earlier than thirty 
days from the date of the final judgment in order 
to allow Gaffney the opportunity to file a notice of 
appeal to seek a stay of the final judgment.

--------









































Whitley v. City of Brandon, 15 So.3d 483 (Miss. App. 2009)

15 So.3d 483
John Thelbert WHITLEY, Appellant,

v.
CITY OF BRANDON, Mississippi, Appellee.

No. 2008-CA-00066-COA.
Court of Appeals of Mississippi.

May 5, 2009.
Rehearing Denied August 18, 2009.

[15 So.3d 484]

        Harry Jones Rosenthal, attorney for 
appellant.

        Mark C. Baker, Jarrod Watkins Taylor, 
Brandon, attorneys for appellee.

        Before MYERS, P.J., GRIFFIS and ISHEE, 
JJ.

        ISHEE, J., for the Court.

        ¶ 1. On December 14, 2007, the Chancery 
Court of Rankin County entered a judgment 
finding John Whitley to be in violation of the City 
of Brandon's (the City) ordinances and granting 
an injunction in favor of the City. The injunction 
required Whitley to remove all offending vehicles 
from his property and to refrain from storing any 
more such vehicles on his property. Aggrieved by 
the judgment, Whitley appeals. He asserts the 
following alleged points of error:

        I. The chancellor erred in failing to recognize 
Whitley's right to continue a nonconforming use 
of his property after the City's annexation.

        II. The chancellor erred in failing to recognize 
Whitley's rights under the Right to Farm Statute, 
and the City's nuisance ordinance is 
unconstitutionally vague.

        III. The chancellor erred in refusing to allow 
Whitley to post a supersedeas bond staying 
enforcement of the judgment pending the 
outcome of the present appeal.

        Finding no error, we affirm the chancellor's 
judgment.

FACTS AND PROCEDURAL HISTORY

        ¶ 2. In May 2007, the City completed its 
annexation of certain property, which included 
Whitley's property located along Highway 471. A 
number of inoperable motor vehicles, in various 
states of repair, were located on Whitley's 
property. The City notified Whitley via certified 
letter that he was in violation of city zoning 
ordinances by parking inoperable and unlicensed 
motor vehicles on his residential property and not 
in his driveway. Whitley was given thirty days to 
comply with the ordinances, and when he failed to 
come into compliance, the City cited him for three 
violations. For his violations, the City of Brandon 
Municipal Court fined Whitley $1,500 plus costs 
of $288. He then appealed to the County Court of 
Rankin County.

        ¶ 3. The City later filed a complaint for 
injunctive relief in the county court, asking that 
the court order Whitley to remove the offending 
vehicles. Whitley objected to jurisdiction in 
county court, and the case was transferred to the 
Chancery Court of Rankin County. During the 
trial, the City offered testimony that the vehicles 
on Whitley's property were, for the most part, 
inoperable junk vehicles. The evidence included a 
number of photographs depicting the condition of 
the vehicles. The problem, according to Robbie 
Powers, with the City's code enforcement division, 
was that Whitley's property was zoned residential, 
but Whitley maintained forty-six "inoperable, 
unlicensed, untagged vehicles." Powers noted that 
several of the vehicles were dismantled or 
wrecked. He described them as "basically, 
abandoned in a pasture." Additionally, the City 
offered testimony that storing the number of 
vehicles that Whitley did, which were in that 
condition, would decrease the property value in 
the surrounding properties. Further testimony

[15 So.3d 485]

indicated that the inoperable vehicles could lead 
to health issues, environmental issues, and 
vandalism on or around the property.



Whitley v. City of Brandon, 15 So.3d 483 (Miss. App. 2009)

        ¶ 4. In a bench ruling on the matter, the 
chancellor noted that Whitley had been found 
criminally liable for violating the city ordinances 
and had been ordered to pay a fine. The 
chancellor then found that: (1) injunctive relief 
was appropriate because there was no other 
adequate remedy at law; (2) the City proved a 
nuisance based on the potential for irreparable 
harm or injury; and (3)Whitley was in violation of 
the city ordinances that, in part, prohibited the 
storage of inoperative and unlicensed motor 
vehicles on residential property. The chancellor 
ordered Whitley to remove all pickups and 
passenger vehicles on his property, along with the 
dump trucks and tractor trailers. Excepted from 
the injunction were a white Chevrolet pickup 
truck and any vehicle with a current inspection 
sticker and license tag. Also excepted from the 
injunction were a forklift, a cattle trailer, a farm 
tractor, and a front-end loader, provided that 
each of the vehicles had a current inspection 
sticker and tag. Whitley timely appealed from this 
judgment.

        ¶ 5. After Whitley filed his appeal from the 
chancellor's judgment, the City filed a Motion for 
Contempt, Permission to Enter Property and 
Execute on Judgment and Related Relief. Whitley 
provided a cost estimate to remove the offending 
vehicles of $1,250, quoted by ACE Auto Sales. It 
would cost an additional $300 per month to store 
the vehicles. The chancellor found Whitley to be 
in contempt and ordered him to comply with the 
prior judgment by February 29, 2008. Having 
continuously failed to comply with orders to 
remove the offending vehicles, the chancellor 
authorized the Sheriff of Rankin County to 
incarcerate Whitley until he came into compliance 
with the judgment of December 14, 2007. Whitley 
was in jail for eight days, during which time the 
vehicles were removed from his property.1

STANDARD OF REVIEW

        ¶ 6. This Court gives deference to the findings 
of a chancellor and will not disturb those findings 
unless they are manifestly wrong, unsupported by 
substantial evidence, or were the result of the 
application of an erroneous legal standard. 

Keener Props., L.L.C. v. Wilson, 912 So.2d 954, 
956(¶ 3) (Miss.2005). However, this Court will 
review questions of law under a de novo standard. 
Id.

DISCUSSION

        I. Right to Continue a Nonconforming 
Use

        ¶ 7. Whitley begins by arguing that he, his 
father, and his grandfather had used the property 
in question for farming for more than one 
hundred years prior to it being annexed by the 
City. He further argues that he used the various 
vehicles that he stored on the property as storage 
for his farming equipment and supplies.

        ¶ 8. Section 2004 of the City's Code of 
Ordinances provides that a lawful nonconforming 
use of land may continue so long as the use 
remains lawful. Regarding a party's right to 
continue a nonconforming use, the supreme court 
has stated the following:

[15 So.3d 486]

        The nature of the right to a non-conforming 
use is a property right. It has been held that the 
right to continue a non-conforming use, once 
established and not abandoned, runs with the 
land. It has been held by some courts that any 
ordinance which takes away that right in an 
unreasonable manner, or in a manner not 
grounded in the public welfare is invalid.

        Barrett v. Hinds County, 545 So.2d 734, 737 
(Miss.1989) (internal citations omitted).

        ¶ 9. Amanda Tolsted, the community 
development and planning director for the City, 
testified on behalf of the City. She said that 
Whitley's property was zoned for low density 
residential use, and she said that Whitley's use of 
the property was agricultural. According to 
Tolsted, the agricultural use was nonconforming, 
but she saw no indication that "the inoperable 
vehicles and the junked cars" were part of any 
agricultural use of the property. She admitted that 



Whitley v. City of Brandon, 15 So.3d 483 (Miss. App. 2009)

some pieces of equipment on the property could 
be used for agricultural reasons but not the 
"junked inoperable vehicles."

        ¶ 10. Whitley cites no authority indicating 
that he should be allowed to maintain a nuisance 
following rezoning or annexation as he would be 
allowed to continue a nonconforming use of his 
land. From the record, it is clear that the 
chancellor took great care in examining the 
vehicles, and he allowed Whitley to keep any 
vehicles that were usable in his farming 
operation. The judgment also makes it clear that 
the only vehicles that had to be removed were the 
inoperable and unlicensed vehicles.

        ¶ 11. Ultimately, we find no violation of 
Whitley's right to continue his nonconforming use 
of the land. The inoperable and junked vehicles 
were a nuisance as defined in the City's 
ordinance, and their removal was to benefit the 
public welfare. The nonconforming-use ordinance 
allowed for the continuation of a lawful 
nonconforming use; however, a nuisance is not a 
lawful nonconforming use. Therefore, we find no 
merit to this issue.

        II. Whitley's Rights Under the Right to 
Farm Statute and the City's Nuisance 
Claim

        ¶ 12. Next, Whitley argues that the City's 
nuisance ordinance was unconstitutionally vague 
and that it was, therefore, improper to enforce the 
ordinance against him. He also continues to make 
the argument that he should have been allowed to 
continue his nonconforming use—a farming 
operation.

        ¶ 13. We see nothing in the record to indicate 
that the City attempted to preclude Whitley from 
carrying on his farming operations. Any assertion 
by Whitley to the contrary is without merit. As 
previously noted, Tolsted testified that the 
farming qualified as a nonconforming use.

        ¶ 14. "A governmental enactment is 
impermissibly vague where it fails to provide 
persons of ordinary intelligence a reasonable 

opportunity to understand what conduct it 
prohibits." Mayor of Clinton v. Welch, 888 So.2d 
416, 421(¶ 27) (Miss.2004) (citing Hill v. 
Colorado, 530 U.S. 703, 732, 120 S.Ct. 2480, 147 
L.Ed.2d 597 (2000)). A statute may also be 
impermissibly vague "if it authorizes or even 
encourages arbitrary and discriminatory 
enforcement." Hill, 530 U.S. at 732, 120 S.Ct. 
2480 (citing City of Chicago v. Morales, 527 U.S. 
41, 56, 119 S.Ct. 1849, 144 L.Ed.2d 67 (1999)).

        ¶ 15. In citing Whitley for maintaining a 
nuisance, the chancellor found that Whitley was 
in violation of section 34-21(1) of the City's Code 
of Ordinances.2 Section

[15 So.3d 487]

34-21 provides that a nuisance is an act, omission, 
condition, or thing that "[i]njures or endangers 
the comfort, repose, health or safety of others...." 
Section 34-22 of the City's Code of Ordinances 
further provides a nonexclusive list of examples 
that constitute nuisances. Applicable to Whitley 
were the following nuisance examples of 
nuisances: (1) "Noxious weeds and other rank 
vegetation"; (2) "Accumulations of rubbish, trash, 
refuse, junk and other abandoned materials, 
metals, lumber or other things"; (3) "Any 
condition which provides harborage for rats, 
mice, snakes and other vermin"; and (4) "Any 
accumulation of stagnant water permitted or 
maintained on any lot or piece of ground." 
Furthermore, the chancellor noted testimony that 
there had been several occasions of vandalism 
concerning Whitley's vehicles. For example, 
vehicle doors had been removed, and their 
windows and windshields had been smashed.

        ¶ 16. During cross-examination, Tolsted 
reiterated the nuisances for which Whitley had 
been cited. According to Tolsted:

        The nuisance is the breeding ground for the 
vermin. It's the pollutants that leak into the 
ground. It's the—it poses a risk for anyone who 
comes onto that property because the—the glass 
and the engine parts—whether they're invited or 
not invited on the property, it's a risk for anyone, 



Whitley v. City of Brandon, 15 So.3d 483 (Miss. App. 2009)

and that type of accumulation of junk, it attracts 
vandalism.

        ¶ 17. George Guest, who was admitted as an 
expert in engineering, testified that, with regard 
to keeping inoperable vehicles, there were 
concerns with "fuel, oil, antifreeze, sometimes 
there's asbestos in the brakes, mercury in the light 
switches, ... hydraulic fluids, those type [of] 
items." He was also concerned with any leaching 
into the soil of water that comes off these vehicles 
and any runoff from Whitley's property that could 
affect the City's water.

        ¶ 18. We see no merit to Whitley's argument 
that the nuisance ordinance, specifically section 
34-21(1), is unconstitutionally vague. We do not 
address subsections (2) or (3) because the 
chancellor did not address those and did not find 
that Whitley had violated them. The ordinance at 
issue provided a reasonable person an ordinary 
opportunity to understand the prohibited 
conduct. Furthermore, an illustrative list of 
potential nuisances is included in the City's code 
at section 34-22. This issue is without merit.

        III. Supersedeas Bond

        ¶ 19. Rule 62(c) of the Mississippi Rules of 
Civil Procedure provides the standard by which a 
party may request that a court stay an injunction 
pending an appeal. Rule 62(c) provides as 
follows:

        When an interlocutory or final judgment has 
been rendered granting ... an injunction, the court 
in its discretion may suspend, modify, restore, or 
grant an injunction during the pendency of an 
appeal from such judgment upon such terms as to 
bond or otherwise as it considers proper for the 
security of the rights of the adverse party. The 
power of the court to make such an order is not 
terminated by the taking of the appeal.

        The comment to Rule 62(c) provides that an 
application for a stay under Rule 62(c) goes to the 
discretion of the court. M.R.C.P. 62(c) cmt.

        ¶ 20. In the present case, the chancellor 
ordered the City to pay the cost of having the 
offending vehicles removed, with Whitley to pay 
the cost of storing the

[15 So.3d 488]

vehicles. The chancellor also imposed the 
condition that if Whitley succeeded on appeal, the 
City would reimburse Whitley for the storage 
costs.

        ¶ 21. We find that the chancellor properly 
exercised his discretion in refusing to stay the 
injunction pending the appeal. At the same time, 
the chancellor granted Whitley an adequate 
remedy in case he prevailed on appeal. The 
chancellor had already determined that the 
vehicles on Whitley's property posed a threat to 
the environment and to anyone who entered the 
property. We see no reason why the chancellor 
should have stayed the injunction in light of these 
findings, especially considering that the City 
would have been responsible for the expenses of 
moving and storing the vehicles if Whitley had 
succeeded on appeal. Accordingly, we find that 
this issue is without merit.

        ¶ 22. THE JUDGMENT OF THE 
CHANCERY COURT OF RANKIN COUNTY 
IS AFFIRMED. ALL COSTS OF THIS 
APPEAL ARE ASSESSED TO THE 
APPELLANT.

        KING, C.J., LEE AND MYERS, P.JJ., 
IRVING, GRIFFIS, BARNES, ROBERTS, 
CARLTON AND MAXWELL, JJ., CONCUR.

---------------

Notes:

1. It is unclear from the record how the vehicles 
were eventually removed from Whitley's property. 
Whitley claims in his appellate brief that the City 
removed the vehicles. However, the City denies 
that it retained ACE Auto Sales to remove the 
vehicles, and it further denies that anyone 



Whitley v. City of Brandon, 15 So.3d 483 (Miss. App. 2009)

affiliated with the City entered upon Whitley's 
property to remove the vehicles.

2. The chancellor specifically refused to address 
whether Whitley was in violation of subsections 
34-21(2)-(3) because of what the chancellor saw 
as a subjective vagueness present in those 
subsections.

---------------



 Page 1 of  3 

 
 

NOTICE PURSUANT TO MCA 21-19-11( 2) 
 

 
PROPERTY ADDRESS:  ___________________________________________________________________  
 
OWNER:  ______________________________________________________________________________  
 
PARCEL/PPIN #:  _______________________________________________________________________                                                                                 
                                                                                  
NOTICE MAILED TO: 

 
 ___________________________________________________  
 
 ___________________________________________________  
 
 ___________________________________________________  

 
(Address of property or parcel of land) 

 
 ___________________________________________________  
 
 ___________________________________________________  
 
 ___________________________________________________  

 
(Address where ad valorem tax notices for the subject property or parcel of land are sent) 
 
 ___________________________________________________ 
 
 ___________________________________________________ 
 
 ___________________________________________________ 
 
Be advised that the governing authority of the City of _______________, having a population 
over one thousand five hundred (1500), has authorized __________________________ and/or 
his designee to determine whether the property or parcel of land is in such a state of 
uncleanliness as to be a menace to the public health, safety and welfare of the community 
when the fee or cost to clean property or a parcel of land that is one (1) acre or less does 
not exceed Two Hundred Fifty Dollars ($250.00), excluding administrative costs. 
 
The particular condition(s) as determined by the authorized municipal employee existing as 
of the date of this notice is: 
 
 _______________________________________________________________________________________  
 
 _______________________________________________________________________________________  
 
 _______________________________________________________________________________________   
 



 Page 2 of  3 

 _______________________________________________________________________________________  
 
 _______________________________________________________________________________________  
 
 _______________________________________________________________________________________  
(Attach additional sheets if necessary). 
 
Be advised that by this correspondence a determination has been made that the condition 
of property or parcel of land as described is a menace to the public health, safety and 
welfare of the community, and as such the governing authority of the City, if the owner does 
not do so himself, on or before ______________, ____, 20____, shall proceed to clean the land, 
by the use of municipal employees or by contract, by cutting grass and weeds, filling 
cisterns. removing rubbish, abandoned or dilapidated fences, outside toilets, abandoned or 
dilapidated buildings, slabs, personal property, which removal of personal property shall not 
be subject to the provisions of Section 21-39-21, and other debris; and draining cesspools 
and standing water therefrom.  
 
YOU ARE ADVISED THAT AN ADJUDICATION AT THE HEARING THAT THE PROPERTY OR PRACEL 
OF LAND IS IN NEED OF CLEANING WILL AUTHORIZE THE MUNICIPALITY TO REENTER THE 
PROPERTY OR PARCEL OF LAND FOR A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS AFTER THE FINAL 
ADJUDICATION WITHOUT ANY FURTHER HEARING IF NOTICE IS POSTED ON THE PROPERTY OR 
PARCEL OF LAND AND AT CITY HALL OR ANOTHER PLACE IN THE MUNICIPALITY WHERE SUCH 
NOTICES ARE GENERALLY POSTED AT LEAST SEVEN (7) DAYS BEFORE THE PROPERTY OR 
PARCEL OF LAND IS REENTERED FOR CLEANING.  A COPY OF THE REQUIRED NOTICE MAILED 
AND POSTED AS REQUIRED BY MCA SECTION 21-19-11(2)(a)&(b) SHALL BE RECORDED IN THE 
MINUTES OF THE GOVERNING AUTHORITY IN CONJUNCTION WITH THE HEARING REQUIRED BY 
SAID SECTION. 
 
Thereafter, the governing authority shall by resolution adjudicate the actual cost of 
cleaning the property under this provision, provided the same does not exceed Two 
Hundred Fifty Dollars ($250.00) and may also impose a penalty not to exceed One Hundred 
Dollars ($100.00) or one hundred percent (100%) of the actual cost of cleaning the property, 
whichever is more. The cost and any penalty imposed may become a civil debt against the 
property owner, and/or, at the option of the governing authority, an assessment against the 
property. The "cost assessed against the property" means either the cost to the municipality 
of using its own employees to do the work or the cost to the municipality of any contract 
executed by the municipality to have the work done and additionally may include 
administrative costs of the municipality not to exceed Fifty Dollars ($50.00). For subsequent 
cleaning within the one-year period, upon seven (7) days' notice posted both on the 
property or parcel of land adjudicated in need of cleaning and at city hall or another 
place in the municipality where such notices are generally posted, and consistent with the 
municipal official's determination as authorized, a municipality may reenter the property or 
parcel of land to maintain cleanliness without further notice or hearing no more than six (6) 
times in any twelve-month period with respect to removing abandoned or dilapidated 
buildings, slabs, dilapidated fences and outside toilets, and no more than twelve (12) times 
in any twenty-four-month period with respect to cutting grass and weeds and removing 
rubbish, personal property and other debris on the land, and the expense of cleaning of the 
property shall not exceed an aggregate amount of One Thousand Dollars ($1,000.00) per 
year. The governing authority may assess the same actual costs, administrative costs, and 
penalty for each time the property or land is cleaned as otherwise provided. The penalty 
provided herein shall not be assessed against the State of Mississippi upon request for 



 Page 3 of  3 

reimbursement under Section 29-1-145, nor shall a municipality clean a parcel owned by 
the State of Mississippi without first giving notice. Upon written authority from the Secretary of 
State's office, for state-owned properties, a municipality may forgo the notification process 
that is prescribed in this subsection and proceed to clean the properties and assess costs as 
prescribed in this subsection, except that, penalties shall not be assessed against the State 
of Mississippi. A determination made by an appropriate municipal employee under this 
subsection (2) that the state or condition of property or a parcel of land is a menace to the 
public health, safety and welfare of the community shall not subsequently be used to 
replace a hearing if Section 21-19-11(1) is later utilized by a municipality when the 
prerequisites of Section 21-19-11(2) are not satisfied. 
 
An appeal of this decision may be made to the governing authority of the City and such 
appeal shall be in writing, state the basis for the appeal and be filed with the city clerk no 
later than seven (7) days from the latest date of notice required under MCA 21-19-11(2).   
 
For any questions, please call _______________________ for the City at ____________. 
 
This the             day of                                    202____. 
 
 
                                                                                            
_________________________ 
Signature 
 
_________________________ 
Name  Title 

 
 
************************** 

A copy of this notice shall be recorded in the minutes of the governing authority in 
conjunction with MCA Section 21-19-11 (2). 
 
At least seven (7) days before the date of cleaning, this notice is required to be posted on 
the property or parcel of land identified herein AND at city hall or such other place in the 
municipality where such notices are posted AND is required to be mailed, via United States 
Mail, postage prepaid, to the address of the property or parcel of land identified herein 
except where the land or structure(s) is apparently vacant, AND to the address where the 
ad valorem tax notice for the property or parcel of land identified herein is sent by the office 
charged with collecting ad valorem taxes for the subject property or parcel of land 
identified herein. 
 
 
This Notice was posted on the subject property on:  _____________________________________  
By: ____________________________________________________________________________________   
 
This Notice was posted at city hall on:  __________________________________________________  
By: ____________________________________________________________________________________  
 
This Notice was mailed via United States Mail, postage prepaid, to each address identified 
above on:  ____________________________________________________________________________  
By: ____________________________________________________________________________________  



1 
 

 
 

NOTICE PURSUANT TO MCA 21-19-11(1) (1972 AS AMENDED) 
 
PROPERTY ADDRESS:  ___________________________________________________________________  
 
OWNER:  ______________________________________________________________________________  
 
PARCEL/PPIN #:  _______________________________________________________________________                                                                                 
                                                                                  
NOTICE MAILED TO: 

 ___________________________________________________  
 
 ___________________________________________________  
 
 ___________________________________________________  

 
(Address of property or parcel of land) 

 ___________________________________________________  
 
 ___________________________________________________  
 
 ___________________________________________________  

 
(Address where ad valorem tax notices for the subject property or parcel of land are sent) 
 
 
PLEASE TAKE NOTICE THAT on its own motion, the City of _______________, Mississippi will hold 
a hearing on the         day of                               , ______, at ___:__0 o’clock 
p.m., at the City of ______________ City Hall, Board Room, 
_________________________________________________, to determine whether or not the above 
described property or parcel of land is in such a state of uncleanliness as to be a menace 
to the public health, safety and welfare of the community. 
 
The particular condition complained existing as of the date of this notice is: 
 _______________________________________________________________________________________  
 _______________________________________________________________________________________  
 _______________________________________________________________________________________   
 _______________________________________________________________________________________  
 _______________________________________________________________________________________  
 _______________________________________________________________________________________  
 _______________________________________________________________________________________  
(Attach additional sheets if necessary). 
 
If, at such hearing, the governing authority shall adjudicate the property or parcel of land in its 
then condition to be a menace to the public health, safety and welfare of the community, the 
governing authority, if the owner does not do so himself, shall proceed to clean the land, by the 
use of municipal employees or by contract, by cutting grass and weeds; filling cisterns; removing 
rubbish, abandoned or dilapidated fences, outside toilets, abandoned or dilapidated buildings, 
slabs, personal property, which removal of personal property shall not be subject to the 



2 
 

provisions of Section 21-39-21, and other debris; and draining cesspools and standing water 
therefrom. YOU ARE ADVISED THAT AN ADJUDICATION AT THE HEARING THAT THE PROPERTY OR 
PRACEL OF LAND IS IN NEED OF CLEANING WILL AUTHORIZE THE MUNICIPALITY TO REENTER THE 
PROPERTY OR PARCEL OF LAND FOR A PERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS AFTER THE FINAL 
ADJUDICATION WITHOUT ANY FURTHER HEARING IF NOTICE IS POSTED ON THE PROPERTY OR 
PARCEL OF LAND AND AT CITY HALL OR ANOTHER PLACE IN THE MUNICIPALITY WHERE SUCH 
NOTICES ARE GENERALLY POSTED AT LEAST SEVEN (7) DAYS BEFORE THE PROPERTY OR PARCEL OF 
LAND IS REENTERED FOR CLEANING.  A COPY OF THE REQUIRED NOTICE MAILED AND POSTED AS 
REQUIRED BY MCA SECTION 21-19-11(1)(B) SHALL BE RECORDED IN THE MINUTES OF THE 
GOVERNING AUTHORITY IN CONJUNCTION WITH THE HEARING REQUIRED BY SAID SECTION.   
 
The governing authority may by resolution adjudicate the actual cost of cleaning the property 
and may also impose a penalty not to exceed One Thousand Five Hundred Dollars ($1,500.00) or 
fifty percent (50%) of the actual cost, whichever is more. The cost and any penalty may become 
a civil debt against the property owner, and/or, at the option of the governing authority, an 
assessment against the property. The “cost assessed against the property” means either the cost 
to the municipality of using its own employees to do the work or the cost to the municipality of 
any contract executed by the municipality to have the work done, and administrative costs and 
legal costs of the municipality. For subsequent cleaning within the one-year period after the 
date of the hearing at which the property or parcel of land was adjudicated in need of 
cleaning, upon seven (7) days’ notice posted both on the property or parcel of land 
adjudicated in need of cleaning and at city hall or another place in the municipality where such 
notices are generally posted, and consistent with the municipality’s adjudication, a municipality 
may reenter the property or parcel of land to maintain cleanliness without further notice or 
hearing no more than six (6) times in any twelve-month period with respect to removing 
abandoned or dilapidated buildings, slabs, dilapidated fences and outside toilets, and no more 
than twelve (12) times in any twenty-four-month period with respect to cutting grass and weeds 
and removing rubbish, personal property and other debris on the land, and the expense of 
cleaning of the property, except as otherwise provided for removal of hazardous substances, 
shall not exceed an aggregate amount of Twenty Thousand Dollars ($20,000.00) per year, or the 
fair market value of the property subsequent to cleaning, whichever is more. The aggregate 
cost of removing hazardous substances will be the actual cost of such removal to the 
municipality and shall not be subject to the Twenty Thousand Dollar ($20,000.00) limitation. The 
governing authority may assess the same penalty for each time the property or land is cleaned. 
 
If the governing authority declares, by resolution, that the cost and any penalty shall be 
collected as a civil debt, the governing authority may authorize the institution of a suit on open 
account against the owner of the property in a court of competent jurisdiction in the manner 
provided by law for the cost and any penalty, plus court costs, reasonable attorney’s fees and 
interest from the date that the property was cleaned. 
 
If the governing authority declares that the cost and any penalty shall be collected as an 
assessment against the property, then the assessment above provided for shall be a lien against 
the property and may be enrolled in the office of the chancery clerk of the county as liens and 
encumbrances are enrolled, and the tax collector of the municipality shall, upon order of the 
board of governing authorities, proceed to sell the land to satisfy the lien as now provided by 
law for the sale of lands for delinquent municipal taxes. The lien against the property shall be an 
encumbrance upon the property and shall follow title of the property. 
 
 (i)  All assessments levied under the provisions hereof shall be included with municipal 
ad valorem taxes and payment shall be enforced in the same manner in which payment is 
enforced for municipal ad valorem taxes, and all statutes regulating the collection of other taxes 



3 
 

in a municipality shall apply to the enforcement and collection of the assessments levied under 
the provisions of this section, including utilization of the procedures authorized under Sections 
17-13-9(2) and 27-41-2. 
 
 (ii) All assessments levied under the provisions hereof shall become delinquent at the 
same time municipal ad valorem taxes become delinquent. Delinquencies shall be collected in 
the same manner and at the same time delinquent ad valorem taxes are collected and shall 
bear the same penalties as those provided for delinquent taxes. If the property is sold for the 
nonpayment of an assessment under this section, it shall be sold in the manner that property is 
sold for the nonpayment of delinquent ad valorem taxes. If the property is sold for delinquent ad 
valorem taxes, the assessment under this section shall be added to the delinquent tax and 
collected at the same time and in the same manner. 
 
All decisions rendered under the provisions of this section may be appealed in the same manner 
as appeals from other action of municipal governing authorities are taken.   
 
For any questions, please call ___________________, the _________________________ for the City at 
__________________. 
 
This the             day of                                   ,             . 
 
 
                                                                                            
Name       Title 

 
 
************************** 

A copy of this notice shall be recorded in the minutes of the governing authority in 
conjunction with the hearing required by MCA Section 21-19-11 (1972 as amended). 
 
Notice shall be provided to the property owner by: 
 
(a) United States mail two (2) weeks before the date of the hearing mailed to the address of 
the subject property AND to the address where the ad valorem tax notice for such property 
is sent by the office charged with collecting ad valorem tax; and 
 
(b) Posting notice for at least two (2) weeks before the date of a hearing on the property or 
parcel of land alleged to be in need of cleaning and at city hall or another place in the 
municipality where such notices are posted. 
 
 
This Notice was posted on the subject property on:  _____________________________________  
By: ____________________________________________________________________________________   
 
This Notice was posted at city hall on:  __________________________________________________  
By: ____________________________________________________________________________________  
 
This Notice was mailed via United States Mail, postage prepaid, to each address identified 
above on:  ____________________________________________________________________________  
By: ____________________________________________________________________________________  
 



RESOLUTION RE: CLEAN-UP OF 
________________ (TAX PARCEL #_____, PPIN#_______), ___________, MISSISSIPPI 

(MCA 21-19-11(1)) 
 

 BE IT RESOLVED by the Mayor and Board of Aldermen of the City of ___________, 

that on the ____ day of _________, 20___, at ___:00 o’clock p.m. at the ____________ City 

Hall, Regular Meeting Room, _____________________, Mississippi, a Public Hearing was held 

to determine whether or not the parcel of property identified above, is in such a state of 

uncleanliness as to be a menace to the public health and safety of the community.    

 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that a notice of said Public Hearing was provided in 

accordance with MCA Section 21-19-11(1).  A copy of the notice, as posted and provided, is 

appended to the Minutes and incorporated herein. 

 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that at said hearing the governing authority, having 

received information from the ___________________________ Department relative to the 

condition of the improvements located on the subject parcel and the general condition of the 

property, which is appended to the Minutes and incorporated herein, did adjudicate such parcel 

of land in its then condition to be a menace to the public health and safety of the community and 

directed that the same be cleaned up by the use of municipal employees or by contract, by 

cutting grass and weeds; filling cisterns; removing rubbish, abandoned and dilapidated fences, 

outside toilets, abandoned or dilapidated buildings, slabs, personal property, which removal of 

personal property shall not be subject to the provisions of Section 21-39-21, and other debris; 

and draining cesspools and standing water therefrom, in accordance with MCA Section 

21-19-11, and as generally outlined in the information including the case file provided by the 

_______________Department, all of which is appended hereto and incorporated herein by 

reference, and that assessments and costs be assessed and taxed against the property in 

accordance with said statute. 

 SO RESOLVED this the ______ day of _________, 202____. 
                                                              
       MAYOR 
ATTEST: 
 
                                             
CITY CLERK 



 Page 1 of  3 

RESOLUTION AND ORDER ADJUDICATING THE COST OF CLEANING OF PROPERTY 
LOCATED AT _____________________, (TAX PARCEL #_____, PPIN#_______), 

___________, MISSISSIPPI AND ASSESSING SAID COSTS AGAINST SAID PROPERTY 
(MCA 21-19-11(1) 

  

 BE IT RESOLVED that the Mayor and Board of Aldermen of the City of _________, 

Mississippi, on the ____ day of _________ 202___, at ___:00 o’clock p.m. at the ___________ 

City Hall, Regular Meeting Room, __________________________________________, 

_________, Mississippi, held a Public Hearing pursuant to MCA Section 21-19-11 (1972 as 

amended) with respect to that certain real property and improvements located at 

______________ (hereinafter sometimes referred to as “the subject property”). 

   BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the subject property was duly posted and notice of 

the Public Hearing was properly provided in accordance with MCA Section 21-19-11 (1972 as 

amended).  The Minutes of the meeting and the action of the board in relation thereto are 

incorporated herein by reference. 

 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that at said hearing the governing authority did adjudicate 

such parcel of land in its then condition to be a menace to the public health and safety of the 

community and directed that the same be cleaned up by the use of municipal employees or by 

cutting weeds; filling cisterns; removing rubbish, dilapidated fences, outside toilets, dilapidated 

buildings, and other debris including abandoned and inoperable vehicles; and draining 

cesspools and standing water therefrom.  

 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the conditions existing on the subject property which 

caused it to be a menace to the public health and safety of the community as described at the 

hearing were remediated by the City, at a total cost to the City of $________________, which 

amount, is hereby assessed against the subject property. 

 

 



 Page 2 of  3 

 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that in accordance with MCA Section 21-19-11 a penalty 

of $1,500.00 or 50% percent of the actual cost incurred, whichever is more, may be assessed 

by the City in addition to the actual clean-up costs and that the total penalty assessed in this 

matter is $___________________. 

 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that in accordance with MCA Section 21-19-11, the cost 

and any penalty may become a civil debt against the property owner, and/or, at the option of the 

governing authority, an assessment against the property. 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City does hereby assess against the subject 

property the total sum of $                          as clean-up costs and penalties and in 

accordance with said statute, the assessment herein determined shall be a lien against the 

subject property and shall be enrolled in the office of the Chancery Clerk of __________ 

County, Mississippi as other liens and encumbrances are enrolled, and the Tax Collector of 

________________ County, Mississippi, who by inter-local agreement serves as the tax 

collector for the City of Brandon, shall proceed to sell the land to satisfy the lien, as now 

provided by law for the sale of lands for delinquent municipal taxes.  The lien against the 

property shall be an encumbrance upon the property and shall follow title of the property. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED AND ORDERED BY THE MAYOR AND 

BOARD OF ALDERMEN OF THE CITY OF ____________, MISSISSIPPI as follows: 

 1. The actual costs of cleaning the subject property located is $                 and 

that a penalty is imposed in the amount of $_______________ for a total assessment of costs 

and penalties of $                           . 

 2. An assessment in the total sum of $                      is hereby levied and 

shall be a lien against the subject property. 

 3. A copy of this Resolution and Order shall be enrolled in the office of the 

Chancery Clerk of ___________ County, Mississippi as other liens and encumbrances are 



 Page 3 of  3 

enrolled and the ___________ County Tax Collector is hereby ordered to proceed to sell said 

land to satisfy said lien as is now provided for by law for the sale of lands for delinquent 

municipal taxes. 

 4. And further, the cost and penalty may be collected as a civil debt as allowed by 

law against the owner of the property in a court of competent jurisdiction in the manner provided 

by law for the cost and any penalty, plus court costs, reasonable attorney’s fees and interest 

from the date that the property was cleaned.  

 SO RESOLVED AND ORDERED this the     day of                                                      

202___. 

 

                                                               
      MAYOR 
ATTEST: 
 
 
                                                         
CITY CLERK 



 Page 1 of  3 

RESOLUTION AND ORDER ADJUDICATING THE COST OF CLEANING OF PROPERTY 
LOCATED AT _____________________, (TAX PARCEL #_____, PPIN#_______), 

___________, MISSISSIPPI AND ASSESSING SAID COSTS AGAINST SAID PROPERTY 
(MCA SECTION 21-19-11(2)) 

  

 BE IT RESOLVED that by authority of the Mayor and Board of Aldermen of the City of 

________________, Mississippi, the ____________________________ made the 

determination that such parcel of land in its then condition to be a menace to the public health 

and safety of the community and directed that the same be cleaned up by the use of municipal 

employees or by cutting weeds; filling cisterns; removing rubbish, dilapidated fences, outside 

toilets, dilapidated buildings, and other debris including abandoned and inoperable vehicles; and 

draining cesspools and standing water therefrom.  

 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the conditions existing on the subject property which 

caused it to be a menace to the public health and safety of the community as described at the 

hearing were remediated by the City, at a total cost to the City of $___________, which amount, 

is hereby assessed against the subject property. 

 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that in accordance with MCA Section 21-19-11 a penalty 

of $100.00 or 100% percent of the actual cost incurred, whichever is more, may be assessed by 

the City in addition to the actual clean-up costs and that the total penalty assessed in this matter 

is $__________________. 

 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that in accordance with MCA Section 21-19-11, the cost 

and any penalty may become a civil debt against the property owner, and/or, at the option of the 

governing authority, an assessment against the property. 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City does hereby assess against the subject 

property the total sum of $___________ as clean-up costs and penalties and in accordance with 

said statute, the assessment herein determined shall be a lien against the subject property and 

shall be enrolled in the office of the Chancery Clerk of Rankin  County, Mississippi as other 



 Page 2 of  3 

liens and encumbrances are enrolled, and the Tax Collector of ___________ County, who by 

inter-local agreement serves as the tax collector for the City, shall proceed to sell the land to 

satisfy the lien as now provided by law for the sale of lands for delinquent municipal taxes.  The 

lien against the property shall be an encumbrance upon the property and shall follow title of the 

property. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED AND ORDERED BY THE MAYOR AND 

BOARD OF ALDERMEN OF THE CITY OF ____________, MISSISSIPPI as follows: 

 1. The actual costs of cleaning the subject property located is $_____________ and 

that a penalty is imposed in the amount of $_______________ for a total assessment of costs 

and penalties of $________________. 

 2. An assessment in the total sum of $_____________ is hereby levied and shall be 

a lien against the subject property. 

 3. A copy of this Resolution and Order shall be enrolled in the office of the 

Chancery Clerk of _____________ County, Mississippi and the _____________ County Tax 

Collector is hereby ordered to proceed to sell said land to satisfy said lien as is now provided for 

by law for the sale of lands for delinquent municipal taxes. 

 4. And further, the cost and penalty may be collected as a civil debt as allowed by 

law against the owner of the property in a court of competent jurisdiction in the manner provided 

by law for the cost and any penalty, plus court costs, reasonable attorney’s fees and interest 

from the date that the property was cleaned. 

 

 

 

 

  



 Page 3 of  3 

 SO RESOLVED AND ORDERED this the     day of                                                      

202___. 

 

                                                               
      MAYOR 
ATTEST: 
 
 
                                                         
CITY CLERK 



- CODE OF ORDINANCES
Chapter 34 - ENVIRONMENT 

ARTICLE II. NUISANCES 
 
 

Brandon, Mississippi, Code of Ordinances    Created: 2022-05-15 17:01:14 [EST]

(Supp. No. 60) 

Page 1 of 3 

ARTICLE II. NUISANCES1

DIVISION 1. GENERALLY 

Sec. 34-21. Definitions.

The following words, terms and phrases, when used in this article, shall have the meanings ascribed to them 
in this section, except where the context clearly indicates a different meaning:  

Nuisance means any act, omission, condition or thing that:  

(1) Injures or endangers the comfort, repose, health or safety of others;  

(2) Offends decency;  

(3) Is offensive to the senses;  

(4) Unlawfully interferes with, obstructs or tends to obstruct or renders dangerous for passage any public 
or private street, highway, sidewalk, stream, ditch or drainage;  

(5) In any way renders other persons insecure in life or the use of property;  

(6) Essentially interferes with the comfortable enjoyment of life and property, or tends to depreciate the 
value of the property of others; or  

(7) Any place as defined in this section in or upon which lewdness, assignation or prostitution is 
conducted, permitted, continued or exists or any other place as defined in this section in or upon which 
a controlled substance as defined in MCA 1972, § 41-29-105, is unlawfully used, possessed, sold or 
delivered and the personal property and contents used in conducting or maintaining any such place for 
any such purpose. One single act of unlawful cohabitation, lewdness or possession, use, sale or delivery 
of a controlled substance about such property shall not come within the terms of this definition.  

Place means and includes any building, erection or structure, or any separate part or portion thereof or the 
ground itself.  

Cross reference(s)—Definitions generally, § 1-2.  

State law reference(s)—Nuisance defined, MCA 1972, § 95-3-1.  

Sec. 34-22. Illustrative enumeration.

The maintaining, using, placing, depositing, leaving or permitting to be or remain on any public or private 
property of any of the following items, conditions or actions is hereby declared to be and constitute a nuisance; 

 

1Cross reference(s)—Gatherings of birds as nuisance situation, § 14-112; sanitation nuisances, § 66-8; junked 
vehicles, appliances and equipment, § 66-9.  

State law reference(s)—Abatement of nuisances generally, MCA 1972, § 21-19-1; cleaning private property, MCA 
1972, § 21-19-11.  



   Created: 2022-05-15 17:01:13 [EST]

(Supp. No. 60) 

Page 2 of 3 

provided, however, that this enumeration shall not be deemed or construed to be conclusive, limiting or 
restrictive:  

(1) Noxious weeds and other rank vegetation.  

(2) Accumulations of rubbish, trash, refuse, junk and other abandoned materials, metals, lumber or other 
things.  

(3) Any condition which provides harborage for rats, mice, snakes and other vermin.  

(4) Any building or other structure which is in such a dilapidated condition that it is unfit for human 
habitation, or kept in such an insanitary condition that it is a menace to the health of people residing in 
the vicinity thereof, or presents a more than ordinarily dangerous fire hazard in the vicinity where it is 
located.  

(5) All unauthorized noises and vibrations, including animal noises.  

(6) All obnoxious odors and stenches, as well as the conditions, substances or other causes which give rise 
to the emission or generation of such odors and stenches.  

(7) The carcasses of animals or fowl not disposed of within a reasonable time after death.  

(8) The pollution of any public well or cistern, stream, lake, canal or body of water by sewage, dead 
animals, creamery or industrial wastes or other substances.  

(9) Any building, structure or other place or location where any activity which is in violation of local, state 
or federal law is conducted, performed or maintained.  

(10) Any accumulation of stagnant water permitted or maintained on any lot or piece of ground.  

(11) Dense smoke, noxious fumes, gas, soot or cinders in unreasonable quantities.  

Sec. 34-23. Prohibited. 

It shall be unlawful for any person to cause, permit, maintain or allow the creation or maintenance of a 
nuisance.  

(Ord. of 8-7-84, § 1) 

Sec. 34-24. Notice to abate—Issuance.

Whenever a nuisance is found to exist within the city or within the city's extraterritorial jurisdiction, the 
county health department or a duly designated officer of the city shall give written notice to the owner or 
occupant of the property upon which such nuisance exists or upon the person causing or maintaining the nuisance.  

(Ord. of 8-7-84, § 2) 

Sec. 34-25. Same—Contents.

The notice to abate a nuisance issued under the provisions of this article shall contain:  

(1) An order to abate the nuisance or to request a hearing within a stated time, which shall be reasonable 
under the circumstances.  

(2) The location of the nuisance, if such nuisance is stationary.  

(3) A description of what constitutes the nuisance.  



   Created: 2022-05-15 17:01:14 [EST]

(Supp. No. 60) 

Page 3 of 3 

(4) A statement of actions necessary to abate the nuisance.  

(5) A statement that if the nuisance is not abated as directed and no request for hearing is made within 
the prescribed time, the city will abate such nuisance and assess the cost thereof against such person.  

Sec. 34-26. Same—Service.

The notice to abate a nuisance shall be served as any other legal process may be served pursuant to law.  

(Ord. of 8-7-84, § 2) 

State law reference(s)—Issuance of notice, MCA 1972, § 21-19-11.  

Sec. 34-27. Abatement by city.

Upon the failure of the person upon whom notice to abate a nuisance was served pursuant to the provisions 
of this article to abate such nuisance, the county health department or a duly designated officer of the city shall 
proceed to abate such nuisance and shall prepare a statement of costs incurred in the abatement thereof.  

(Ord. of 8-7-84, § 2) 

Sec. 34-28. City's costs declared lien.

Any and all costs incurred by the city in the abatement of a nuisance under the provisions of this article shall 
constitute a lien against the property upon which such nuisance existed, which lien shall be filed, proven and 
collected as provided for by law. Such lien shall be notice to all persons from the time of its recording, and shall 
bear interest at the legal rate thereafter until satisfied.  

(Ord. of 8-7-84, § 3) 

Sec. 34-29. Enforcement.

In addition to any other provisions or authority of this chapter, or otherwise provided for by law, any person, 
including but not limited to the owner(s), leasee(s), officers of any corporation, partners in any partnership or 
members of any limited liability company or other possessors in interest of any building or premises or part 
thereof where any violation of this chapter shall occur, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and shall be liable for a 
fine of not more than $1,000.00 and/or 30 days in jail, or both and each day such violation shall be permitted to 
exist shall constitutes a separate offense.  

(Ord. of 12-16-03(1), § 1) 

Secs. 34-30. Reserved. 

 



   Created: 2022-05-15 17:01:12 [EST]

(Supp. No. 60) 

Page 1 of 6 

Sec. 18-61. Adoption.

The following codes, with amendments and subject to identified modifications, amendments and exclusions, 
as provided herein, are hereby adopted by reference as though they were copied herein fully and pertain to 
activities occurring within the City of Brandon, Mississippi.  

1. The International Building Code, 2018 Edition, with amendments. Subject to the following:  

a. Delete Chapter 13 Energy Efficiency.  

b. Section 101.1 replace "Name of Jurisdiction" with "The City of Brandon, Mississippi".  

c. Delete Section 103 Department of Building Safety.  

d. Delete Section 113 Board of Appeals.  

e. Table 506.2 add note "j: Group R-1 shall not be allowed to be Type III, IV, or V construction".  

f. Section 1612.3 replace "Insert Name of Jurisdiction" with "The City of Brandon, Mississippi" and 
replace "Insert Date of Issuance" with "June 9, 2014".  

g. Adopt Appendix E Supplementary Accessibility Requirements.  

h. Adopt Appendix F Rodent Proofing.  

2. The International Residential Code, 2018 Edition, with amendments. Subject to the following:  

a. Section R101.1 replace "Name of Jurisdiction" with "The City of Brandon, Mississippi".  

b. Delete Section R103 Department of Building Safety.  

c. Section R105.2 delete Building: #1.  

d. Delete Section R112 Board of Appeals.  

e. Table R301.2(1) Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria, insert:  

Ground Snow Load: 5 lbs. psf   
Wind Speed: 115 mph   
Topographic Effects: No   
Special Wind Region:  No   
Seismic Category:  B  
Weathering: Moderate  
Frost Line Depth:  2 inches  
Termite:  Very heavy   
Winter Design Temp: 25°F  
Ice Barrier Required:  No   
Flood Hazards: Map Number Date 

28121C0183F June 9, 2014  
28121C0184F June 9, 2014  
28121C0191F June 9, 2014  
28121C0192F June 9, 2014  
28121C0193F June 9, 2014  
28121C0194F June 9, 2014  
28121C0205F June 9, 2014  
28121C0211F June 9, 2014  
28121C0215F June 9, 2014  
28121C0220F June 9, 2014  



   Created: 2022-05-15 17:01:12 [EST]

(Supp. No. 60) 

Page 2 of 6 

28121C0335F June 9, 2014  
28121C0355F June 9, 2014  

Air Freezing Index: 150 
Mean Annual Temp: 64° 

f. Section R313.2 replace "shall be installed in one- and two-family dwellings" with "shall not be 
required in one- and two-family dwellings."  

g. Section P2603.5.1 replace "Number" with "12 inches (304 mm)" and replace "Number" with "12 
inches (304 mm.)".  

h. Adopt Appendix E Manufactured Housing Used as Dwellings.  

i. Adopt Appendix F Radon Control Methods.  

j. Adopt Appendix J Existing Buildings and Structures.  

3. The International Mechanical Code, 2018 Edition, with amendments. Subject to the following:  

a. Section 101.1 replace "Name of Jurisdiction" with "The City of Brandon, Mississippi".  

b. Delete Section 103 Department of Mechanical Inspection.  

c. Section 106.5.2 replace "Jurisdiction to Insert Appropriate Schedule" with "See Brandon Code of 
Ordinances, Article II, Section 18-34 Permit Fees".  

d. Section 106.5.3 replace "Specify Percentage" with "50%" and replace "Specify Percentage" with 
"50%".  

e. Section 108.4 replace "Specify Offense" with "Misdemeanor" and replace "Amount" with 
"$1,000.00" and replace "Number of Days" with "90 days".  

f. Section 108.5 replace "Amount" with "$500.00" and replace "Amount" with "$500.00".  

g. Delete Section 109 Means of Appeal.  

4. The International Plumbing Code, 2018 Edition, with amendments. Subject to the following:  

a. Section 101.1 replace "Name of Jurisdiction" with "The City of Brandon, Mississippi".  

b. Delete Section 103 Department of Plumbing Inspection.  

c. Section 106.6.2 replace "Jurisdiction to Insert Appropriate Schedule" with "See Brandon Code of 
Ordinances, Article II, Section 18-34 Permit Fees".  

d. Section 106.6.3 replace "Specify Percentage" with "50%" and replace "Specify Percentage" with 
"50%".  

e. Section 108.4 replace "Specify Offense" with "Misdemeanor" and replace "Amount" with 
"$1,000.00" and replace "Number of Days" with "90 days".  

f. Section 108.5 replace "Amount" with "$500.00" and replace "Amount" with "$500.00".  

g. Delete Section 109 Means of Appeal.  

h. Section 305.4.1 replace "Number" with "12 inches (304 mm)" and replace "Number" with "12 
inches (304 mm)".  

i. Section 903.1 replace "Number" with "6 inches (152 mm)".  

5. The International Fuel Gas Code, 2018 Edition, with amendments. Subject to the following:  



   Created: 2022-05-15 17:01:12 [EST]

(Supp. No. 60) 

Page 3 of 6 

a. Section 101.1 replace "Name of Jurisdiction" with "The City of Brandon, Mississippi".  

b. Delete Section 103 Department of Inspection.  

c. Section 106.6.2 replace "Jurisdiction to Insert Appropriate Schedule" with "See Brandon Code of 
Ordinances, Article II, Section 18-34 Permit Fees".  

d. Section 106.6.3 replace "Specify Percentage" with "50%" and replace "Specify Percentage" with 
"50%".  

e. Section 108.4 replace "Specify Offense" with "Misdemeanor" and replace "Amount" with 
"$1,000.00" and replace "Number of Days" with "90 days".  

f. Section 108.5 replace "Amount" with "$500.00" and replace "Amount" with "$500.00".  

g. Delete Section 109 Means of Appeal.  

h. Section 310.1 insert "All gas systems shall be bonded".  

6. The International Fire Code, 2018 Edition, with amendments. Subject to the following:  

a. Section 101.1 replace "Name of Jurisdiction" with "The City of Brandon, Mississippi".  

b. Delete Section 109 Board of Appeals.  

c. Section 110.4 replace "Specify Offense" with "Misdemeanor" and replace "Amount" with 
"$1,000.00" and replace "Number of Days" with "90 days".  

d. Section 112.4 replace "Amount" with "$500.00" and replace "Amount" with "$500.00".  

e. Section 507.5.5 insert "and fire sprinkler risers".  

f. Section 903.2.3 Group E, revise to read "An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for all 
Group E occupancies" and delete 1, 2, and 3.  

g. Section 903.2.6 Group I remove the exceptions.  

h. Add new Section 903.7 "Group B. An approved automatic sprinkler system shall be provided 
throughout buildings containing Group B occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:  

1. Where a Group B fire area exceeds 10,000 total gross floor area.  

2. Where a Group B is located three or more stories above plane or one story below plane".  

i. Add new Section 1203.2.19 "Group R-1 occupancy. Emergency stand-by power shall be provided 
in all R-1 which are two or more stories in height to power at least one elevator, emergency 
lights, exit signs, fire alarm system, and automatic sprinkler system fire pumps".  

j. Section 903.2.1.1 Group A-1 item number 1 replace "12,000 square feet" with "10,000 square 
feet".  

k. Section 903.2.1.3 Group A-3 item number 1 replace "12,000 square feet" with "10,000 square 
feet".  

l. Section 903.2.1.4 Group A-4 item number 1 replace "12,000 square feet" with "10,000 square 
feet".  

m. Section 903.2.4 Group F-1 item number 1 replace "12,000 square feet" with "7,500 square feet".  

n. Section 903.2.7 Group M item number 1 replace "12,000 square feet" with "10,000 square feet".  

o. Section 903.2.9 Group S-1 item number 1 replace "12,000 square feet" with "10,000 square feet 
total gross floor area".  



   Created: 2022-05-15 17:01:12 [EST]

(Supp. No. 60) 

Page 4 of 6 

p. Section 903.2.9.1 Repair garages item number 1 replace "12,000 square feet" with "4,000 square 
feet total gross floor area".  

q. Section 903.2.9.1 Repair garages item number 2 replace "12,000 square feet" with "4,000 square 
feet total gross floor area".  

r. Add new Section 903.2.10.2 "Group U Miscellaneous. An automatic sprinkler system shall be 
provided throughout all buildings 10,000 or more square feet gross floor area".  

s. Adopt Appendix B Fire-Flow Requirements for Buildings.  

t. Adopt Appendix C Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution.  

u. Adopt Appendix D Fire Apparatus Access Roads.  

v. Adopt Appendix E Hazard Categories.  

w. Adopt Appendix F Hazard Ranking.  

7. The International Property Maintenance Code, 2018 Edition, with amendments. Subject to the 
following:  

a. Section 101.1 replace "Name of Jurisdiction" with "The City of Brandon, Mississippi".  

b. Delete Section 103 Department of Property Maintenance Inspection.  

c. Delete Section 111 Means of Appeal.  

d. Section 112.4 replace "Amount" with "$500.00" and replace "Amount" with "$500.00".  

e. Section 302.4 replace "Jurisdiction to Insert Height in Inches" with "12 inches (104 mm)".  

f. Add "Section 302.4.1 Vegetation planted and maintained for landscaping purposes or for erosion 
control shall be exempt from the requirements of this Section".  

g. Add "Section 302.4.2 Vegetation located beyond fifty feet (50') from the back of curb or edge of 
pavement on a lot over one acre that is in a natural state shall be exempt from the requirements 
of this Section".  

h. Add "Section 302.4.3 Vegetation located on an unimproved, cleared lot shall be maintained to 
prohibit vegetation over 24 inches in height".  

i. Add "Section 302.7.1 Mailboxes. All mailboxes shall be maintained structurally sound and in good 
repair, to include the box, post, and all attachments".  

j. Section 302.8 Motor vehicles. Add "(including lawn mowers, and other motorized equipment)".  

k. Add "Section 302.8.1 Minor repairs (changing oil, air filter replacement, spark plugs, brakes, tires, 
shocks, etc.) and servicing (car washing, detailing, accessory installation, audio installation, etc.) 
are permitted in the residentially zoned districts. Minor repairs of any vehicle performed other 
than within a fully enclosed building shall not exceed a seventy-two (72) hour period of time".  

l. Add "Section 302.8.2 Minor repairs, major repairs and servicing as stated are only permitted on 
vehicles registered to the property owner or tenant of the said property on which the repairs or 
servicing are conducted. Vehicle repair and servicing shops are prohibited within any residential 
district".  

m. Add "Section 302.10 Construction Projects. The following conditions shall be prohibited in 
residentially zoned districts:  



   Created: 2022-05-15 17:01:12 [EST]

(Supp. No. 60) 

Page 5 of 6 

i. Construction projects that are on-going for more than six (6) months and in which active 
work has not occurred. Construction projects with a valid building permit may request a 
time extension due to extenuating circumstances.  

ii. Storage of construction, repair, or maintenance materials or equipment that are not 
associated with an active construction project or building permit.  

iii. Construction debris, building materials, and refuse remaining on property for more than 
thirty (30) days.  

iv. Stockpiles of dirt, sand, gravel, rock, mulch in excess of fourteen (14) days.  

v. Construction projects shall be maintained and shall be free of garbage and rubbish".  

n. Add "Section 302.11 Maintenance of Right-of-Way. It is the responsibility of the property owner 
to keep any alley or adjoining street right-of-way that abuts the owner's property mowed and 
free of trash and debris including edging, weed eating, and excess clipping removal. Excess 
clippings shall not be left, blown, or disposed of in the street or in storm sewer drains. The 
maintenance responsibility of waterways and ditches located within the right-of-way shall be 
subject to the dedication language on filed deeds, agreements, plats, or easements associated 
with the property".  

o. Add "Section 302.12 Demolition and Reconstruction. Any property that is damaged or destroyed 
by fire or other acts of nature shall be demolished or repairs or reconstruction must begin within 
six (6) months of the damage or destruction".  

p. Add "Section 302.13 Garage or Carport. All materials, equipment, or other items of personal 
property shall not be stored inside a carport to the extent that such storage prevents the use of a 
carport for the parking of the number of motor vehicles for which the carport is designed. 
Garages used for the accumulation or storage of personal property that are visible from public 
view shall be kept closed at all times except during ingress and egress from the garage. Concrete 
blocks, lumber, buckets, and other accumulations of items shall be stored in a storage building, 
garage, or behind a fence or wall out of public view".  

q. Section 304.14 replace "Date" with "January 1" and replace "Date" with "December 31".  

r. Add "Section 308.4 Garbage or Refuse Containers. Garbage or refuse containers shall be stored 
out of public view except when placed for collection or when stored in an open carport or garage. 
Garbage or refuse containers shall be returned to the storage location not later than 8:00 am the 
day following collection".  

s. Add "Section 402.4 Exterior Lights. It shall be unlawful for any exterior light to shine directly 
toward an adjacent property".  

t. Section 602.3 replace "Date" with "October 1" and replace "Date" with "April 15".  

u. Section 602.4 replace "Date" with "October 1" and replace "Date" with ''April 15".  

v. Add "Section 704.8 All multi-family units and single-family rental units shall have at least one fire 
extinguisher rated as 2:A 10:BC. This fire extinguisher shall be mounted and kept in a conspicuous 
and easily accessible location and shall be kept in a good working condition at all times".  

8. The National Electrical Code, 2017 Edition.  

9. The International Swimming Pool and Spa Code, 2018 Edition.  

10. The International Existing Building Code, 2018 Edition.  

a. Section 101.1 replace "Name of Jurisdiction" with "The City of Brandon, Mississippi".  



   Created: 2022-05-15 17:01:12 [EST]

(Supp. No. 60) 

Page 6 of 6 

A copy of each code with appendices thereto as set forth herein shall be certified by the mayor and the city 
clerk and shall be filed as a permanent record in the office of said clerk.  

(Code 1982, §§ 8-10—8-16; Ord. of 12-6-94; Ord. of 9-2-97; Ord. of 12-7-04(1), § 1; Ord. of 7-1-08(1), § 1; Ord. of 7-
1-08(2), Exh. A; Ord. of 5-18-15, § 1; Ord. of 6-15-15, § 1; Ord. of 8-7-17(1), § 1; Ord. of 8-6-18, § 1; Ord. of 7-19-
21(1) , § 1) 

 



   Created: 2022-05-15 17:01:24 [EST]

(Supp. No. 60) 

Page 1 of 1 

Sec. 66-9. Junked vehicles, appliances and equipment.

It shall be unlawful for any person in possession, charge or control of any residential or nonpermitted 
business premises to keep, cause to be kept, or allow the keeping on any premises within the city junked vehicles, 
appliances and/or equipment. The depositing, keeping or causing to be deposited or kept on any residential or 
nonpermitted business premises within the city junked vehicles, appliances, and/or equipment is likewise declared 
a public nuisance. The police department and supervisory employees of the department of sanitation, including 
the zoning and building administrator are hereby authorized to inspect any premises in the city for the purpose of 
enforcing the requirements of this section.  

(Ord. of 10-19-93, § 12-16) 

Cross reference(s)—Nuisances generally, § 34-21 et seq.  

 



   Created: 2022-05-15 17:01:30 [EST]

(Supp. No. 60) 

Page 1 of 1 

2.11 Obstructions causing health or safety hazard prohibited.

No rubbish, salvage materials, junk or hazardous waste materials including inoperable vehicles and parts and 
any combustible matter, shall be openly stored, allowed to accumulate or kept in the open, and no weeds and 
other growth shall be allowed to go uncut within any district when the same shall be determined by the 
appropriate city official (the building inspector, fire chief, or other authorized city employee) or health official to 
constitute a menace to the public health and/or safety.  

 



   Created: 2022-05-15 17:01:24 [EST]

(Supp. No. 60) 

Page 1 of 1 

Sec. 58-71. Definitions.

The following words, terms and phrases, when used in this article, shall have the meanings ascribed to them 
in this section, except where the context clearly indicates a different meaning:  

Junkyard means any place where three or more automobiles not in operating condition are located within 
ten feet of each other.  

(Code 1982, § 9-51) 

Cross reference(s)—Definitions generally, § 1-2.  

Sec. 58-72. Location restricted.

It shall be unlawful for any person to operate a junkyard within 200 yards of U.S. Highway No. 80 or 
Mississippi Highway Nos. 18, 468 and 471, in the city.  

(Code 1982, § 9-50) 

 



   Created: 2022-05-15 17:01:24 [EST]

(Supp. No. 60) 

Page 1 of 1 

Sec. 66-1. Definitions.

The following words, terms and phrases, when used in this chapter, shall have the meanings ascribed to 
them in this section, except where the context clearly indicates a different meaning:  

Collector, professional, private, means a private business engaged in the collection and disposal of refuse for 
a profit.  

Collector, special private means a private business or individual engaged in the collection and disposal of 
refuse for purposes other than a profit.  

Container means plastic or chemically-treated paper sacking of at least ten gallons, but not to exceed a 35-
gallon capacity. Plastic containers must be at least two mils thickness and both plastic sacking and chemically-
treated paper sacking must be of such design to permit secure closure when filled.  

Garbage means waste foodstuffs of vegetable or animal origin, together with other incidental admixtures.  

Junked appliances and equipment means all ice boxes, refrigerators, stoves, washing machines, hot water 
tanks, and any type equipment in a state of disrepair and rendered inoperative.  

Junked or abandoned vehicles means any vehicle which is in a state of disrepair and incapable of being 
moved under its own power or rendered inoperative by reason of the lack of essential parts, such as wheels, 
motor, radiator, or other essential components; but shall not include antique vehicles, as hereinafter provided.  

Public view means an area capable of observance by persons from any public way.  

Public way means any street, alley or similar parcel of land essentially unobstructed from the ground to the 
sky, which is deeded, dedicated or otherwise permanently appropriated to the public for public use.  

Rubbish means the waste materials from normal household or living conditions other than garbage, but not 
to include garden, lawn or tree trimmings, leaves or waste materials from building construction or repair.  

Superintendent means the superintendent of sanitation for the city as appointed by the mayor and board of 
aldermen.  

(Ord. of 10-19-93, § 12-1; Ord. of 6-6-11, § 1) 

Cross reference(s)—Definitions generally, § 1-2.  

 


	2026 Presentation
	2026 Outline
	Municipal Property Cleanup: The Good, the Bad and the Ugly
	I. Mississippi Code § 21-19-11
	II. The Cleanup Process Under Section (1)
	A. Initiating the Process
	B. Notice Requirements
	C. Required Notice Content
	D. The Hearing and Adjudication
	E. What Can Be Cleaned/Removed
	F. Important Clarifications
	G. Costs and Penalties
	H. Subsequent Cleanups and Cost Limitations
	I. State Property Exception

	III. Process for Municipalities Over 1,500 Population
	IV. Perpetual Care Cemeteries - Section (7)
	V. Important Case Law
	Okhuysen v. City of Starkville, 333 So.2d 573 (Miss. App. 2022).
	Gaffney v. City of Ridgeland, 202 So. 3d 238 (Miss. App. 2016)

	VI. Alternative Code Enforcement Tools
	A. Nuisance Ordinances (Most Effective Tool)
	B. Junkyard Ordinances
	C. Junked Appliances Ordinance
	D. Open Storage Ordinance
	E. Section 21-19-21 (Structures Damaged by Fire)

	VII. Key Takeaways and Best Practices


	21-19-11
	21-19-20
	21-19-21
	21-39-21
	Misc. AG Opinions
	Gaffney v City of Richland 202 So3d 238 Miss App 2016
	Okhuysen v City of Starkville Miss App. 2022
	Whitley v City of Brandon 15 So3d 483 Miss App 2009
	Clean Up Notice under $250.2026
	Cleanup Public Notice over $250.2026
	Cleanup Resolution 21-19-11(1). 2026
	Resolution Adjudicating the Cost of Cleaning of Property with public hearing.2026
	Resolution Adjudicating the Cost of Cleaning of Property without public hearing.2026

	Ordinances

